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B1 Apple Spice Winter Basket - Pair of handmade ivory mittens, fluffy scarf, apple spice candle

B2 Rock Chock Basket - Jayhawks Royal T-shirt in 2XL, Jayhawks Royal T-shirt in Medium, Jayhawks necklace and earrings, 
KU plush ball, KU ornament

B3 Cat Paws Basket - Vintage Current, Inc. “Caroling Critters” ornament, handmade cat quilt, Cats Leave Paw Prints on you 
Heart hanging, vintage cat clock, holiday cat socks, cat Santa hat, cat pillow kit, ceramic cat bowl, vintage hand-painted cat 
frame

B4 Midwest Wines Basket - White Tail Run Blushing Buck full bodied sweet red wine, Sainte Genevieve Winery Ste. Gemme 
wine a blend of Vignoles and Vidal Blanc, two white cloth napkins, Jakob Demmer wine opener in a ceramic decorated wine 
carrier

B5 Musical Christmas Basket - Seriglass candle screen, note ornament, white pillar candle, Embroidered stocking with 
instruments

B6 Cafe Provence certificate - Cafe' Provence gift card, Cafe' Provence is located at 3936 West 69th Terrace in the Prairie 
Village Shopping Center, voted the Best Restaurant in Kansas City and one of the Top 100 Restaurants in the U.S., serving 
progressive French Provencal cuisine.

B7 Baby Duckies Basket - Handmade baby hat, handmade soft ball, 3 bath duckies, Sesame Street Baby Wash, Shampoo, 
Lotion, Duck puppet washcloth, bug bib

B8 Oil and Vinegar Basket - Handmade ceramic oil and vinegar cruets with lids, Balsamic Vinegar of Modena and Aged 
Balsamic Vinegar of Modena

B9 Garden's Grace Basket - A Garden's Grace book, vintage flower bowl, two handmade soaps, etched glass suncatcher

B10 Stocking Kit Basket - Penguin needlepoint stocking kit, yarn bag, scissors, thimbles

B11 Crochet Basket - If Hooks Could Kill by Betty Hechtman, A Crochet Mystery, eight piece varying size Boye anodized 
aluminum crochet hook set, 3 skeins Yarn Bee Icelandic Jewels variegated yarn in Ruby 3.5 ounce 129 yard

B12 Red Satin Basket - Red Satin earrings and 18” necklace, ivory handmade mittens

B13 Special Dog Basket - Hallmark Keepsake Ornament dog photo holder, denim dog 4x6” photo album, bone-shaped cookie 
cutter, Fold-A-Bowl pet bowl, 9” dog bowl, sisal food mat

B14 Christmas Cat Basket - Vintage Hallmark Keepsake Country Cat ornament, Skiing Cat metal ornament, Ursula Dodge 
Design Adventure Cat bowl, Wilton cat cookie cutter, handmade 21x34” leopard cat blanket

B15 Rustic Gardening Basket - The Wildflower Gardener's Guide, The Colour Dictionary of Garden Plants, handmade bud vase

B16 Amazon.com gift card - Amazon.com gift card

B17 Cozy Winter Nights Basket -  King Size Velvet Plush burgundy blanket, scented burgundy pillar candle, Message in a Bottle 
by Nicholas Sparks, Artemisia by Alexander LaPierre, 

B18 Bird Lover's Basket - Ornamental birdhouse, handmade mug painted with bird, vintage 1979 Hallmark birdhouse ornament, 
two handmade soaps with bird watercolors

B19 Love Song Basket - They're Playing Our Song CD, Romantic Piano CD, Classics for Lovers set of 4 CDs, Hallmark 
Keepsake Together Under the Mistletoe ornament, stained glass heart suncatcher, two hand-painted wine glasses, plastic 
suncatcher

B20 Escape the Cold Basket - Goldcoast Sunwear straw hat, Florida beach tote, Hilasal Super Absorbent 100% cotton beach 
towel

B21 Day with Grandkids Basket - New vintage Eden Toys Primrose doll, Hallmark Crayon photo album with 8 pages, Minions 
Stationery Set (including markers, pencil, sketch pad, etc), Hallmark vintage writing pad, handmade doll quilt
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B22 Snowy Day  Basket - Handmade black patterned mittens, painted glass snowman ornament, handmade mug, fluffy scarf

B23 Let's Paint Basket - Two 12x16” Canvas Panels, 20 Pocket Canvas Craft Caddy, 12 Reeves Acrylic Paint Set, set of 8 fine 
brushes, set of 6 medium to large brushes, handmade ceramic brush holder

B24 Mitten Cookie Jar Basket - Vintage Hallmark Mitten Cookie Jar, vintage Old Navy Holiday Cookie Cutters with recipe and 
case, Hallmark Keepsake Tasty Tannenbaum Christmas Cupcake ornament

B25 Chocolate baskets (two baskets) - From our Violin I section: Hershey's Kiss Cookie Press, Stone Pillar Chocolate 
Sweetheart Wine, Christopher Elbow Chocolates Dark Chocolate Sauce,Dark Chocolate & Almond bar, Toffee & Sea Salt 
bar, Ghirardelli Premium Hot Cocoa Mocha mix, Godiva Strawberry Truffles, Moser Roth 70% Dark Chocolate bar, Choceur 
Marzipan covered in dark chocolate, Dark Chocolate coated butter cookies, Theo Organic Orange 70% bar, Taza Stone 
Ground 84% Dark bar, Ghirardelli Dark Chocolate Blueberry squares, Brookside Dark Chocolate Goji & Raspberry, Fudge 
Brownie mix, Chocolate pudding mix, Milk Chocolate frosting, 12 oz Semi-Sweet Chocolate Chips, 

B26 Galina Massage & Skin Studio certificate - Galina Massage & Skin Studio gift certificate for one 30 minute massage located 
at 7922 State Line Road, Suite 103, Prairie Village, KS

B27 Precious Moments Collectibles - Precious Moments 1991 “The Good Lord Always Delivers” plate and stand, Precious 
Moments 1990 figurine 

B28 Magic of Santa Basket - Four Sakura Magic of Santa plates, four red fabric napkins, magical Santa ornament

B29 Extreme Sports Guy Basket - 750ml Boulevard Smokestack Series Special Release Chocolate Ale with Raspberry (that 
can't be purchased at this time), Street Bike Extreme by Mike Seate book, four large pretzels dipped in caramel then dark 
chocolate and Hawaiian Red Sea Salt, Christian Colon's Rally Sauce Barbeque Sauce

B30 Winter Wonderland Basket - Winter Wonderland Snowman by Terry Redlin, white crocheted angel ornament, black fluffy 
scarf

B31 Spa Meditation Basket – Gel eye mask, Do Not Disturb Lavender Soy Candle, When One Door Closes magnet, Dermasil 
Lotion with Vitamin A & E, two handmade soaps with watercolors, $10 off SAS Shoes in a hand-painted bucket

B32 Gift for Grandma Basket - Twinkle, Twinkle Little Star Recordable Storybook, Grandmother is Another Name for Angel 
ceramic wall hanging, Trader Joe's Vanilla & Cinnamon Black Tea

B33 Three Cups of Tea Basket - Three Cups of Tea, One Man's Mission to Promote Peace...One School at a Time by Greg 
Mortenson and David Oliver Relin, Stash English Breakfast Black Tea, Handmade ceramic teapot with mountain design

B34 A Day for Cocoa Basket - Tan fluffy scarf, tan/brown/ivory patterned mittens, handmade mug, drink mixes

B35 Kansas City Dog Basket - Another Autumn, The Rufus Chronicle by Kansas City's own C. W. Gusewelle, Kansas City's 
Three Dog Bakery Cookbook, New Seasons Doggie Photos Album, IKEA dog rump leash hook

B36 Sassy Face Esthetics certificate - Sassy Face Esthetics gift certificate for $50, dermalogica 0.5 oz facial precleanse, 7 
different dermalogica product samples, OPI Avoplex Cuticle Oil To Go, all in a handy metallic leopard print bag

B37 French Bath Basket - French Algue Seaweed Bath Salts, bath salt handmade ceramic pitcher, two handmade soaps with 
watercolor, SAS Shoes card

B38 Christmas Basket - White ceramic basket with small wreath, four glass votive holders, rechargeable votives

B39 Tea & Honey Basket - Handmade honey pot with wooden honey dipper, Breitsamer Honig 17.6 oz Bavarian Raw Honey, 
Stash Ginger Peach Green Tea with Matcha, Stainless steel mesh tea ball, two Mrs Prindables Dark Chocolate Peppermint 
pretzels

B40 Evening Rehearsals Snowman Basket - Bradford Editions Terry Redlin's Evening Rehearsals snowman, metal snowman 
angel ornament, white candle

B41 Dancing Queen Basket - Handmade jewelry bowl, Sterling silver Diamonique stone necklace, The Nutcracker scene, fluffy 
scarf

B42 Fun with Kids Basket - Everyday Success Activities for Grade 1, Crayola Ultra-Clean Washable Markets, 12 Dr. Seuss 
pencils, Hallmark's Hoops & Yoyo Magnet with sound, Crayola 64 crayons, Construction paper pad, four Mrs Prindables 
Caramel dipped in Milk Chocolate pretzels.

B43 Baking Ninja Basket - Vintage Betty Crocker's Cookbook for Boys and Girls, Ninja gingerbread men cookie cutters, bright 
measuring spoons, bright measuring cups, transportation cookie cutters, brass animal molds

B44 One Naughty, One Nice Basket - Aubrey Vineyards Frontenac Rose wine, Meier's non-alcoholic Sparkling White Catawba 
Grape Juice in a decorative dual wine holder with two plaid napkins



B45 Personal Training Sessions Certificate - Julie Odell will provide six 50 minute training sessions at the Prairie Life Fitness 
Center in Overland Park, KS.  Sessions will be tailored to your fitness level. Julie is a highly qualified fitness trainer who has 
been at Prairie Life for over 16 years.  This expires on December 10, 2017.

B46 Light Green Crocheted Throw Blanket - Light Green hand-crocheted throw blanket or baby blanket by local artist Carolyn 
Shephardson

B47 Take Me Away Basket - Handmade sassy woman ceramic mug, three perfumed shell bath fizzies, Colorado Discover 
America book by Jon Klusmire, Udderly Smooth Hand Cream, Handmade soap with watercolor, gel eye mask, moisturizing 
socks, SAS Shoes card

B48 Hot Cider and Snacks Basket - Gourmet Du Village Dip Chiller, two handmade mugs, Monks Meadow Chardonnay 
Artichoke and Parmesan bread spread

B49 Light and Bright Basket - Two sets of Glitter Bubble lights, 50 count LED Light Set, 25 LED Specialty Tinsel Lights, pair of 
LED 10” Flickering Taper Candles in large, sturdy laundry basket

B50 Have Yourself a Merry Little Christmas Basket - Handmade felted and lined wool mittens, fluffy scarf, white peppermint 
scented pillar candle, metal Santa decoration

B51 Starbucks Basket - Donated by the Ranchmart Starbucks Store: One pound Organic Yukon Blend Starbucks Medium Roast 
coffee beans, a Starbucks ceramic mug that is microwave and dishwasher safe, and a Starbucks Frappuccino key chain, 
store is located at 3807 W 95th Street, Overland Park, KS 66206

B52 French Market Basket - From French Market in the Prairie Village Shops: Cafe Provence Marcona Almonds with Curry, LU 
The' french “biscuits” (cookies),  Carambar caramels, Favols Les Fruitessences Poire Framboise jam, Caramel Mou little 
fudge pieces, orange and cherry lollipops in Vive la France basket

B53 International Food Basket - From our Viola section: Journey to Thailand Thai Red Curry Sauce, Visconti Bruschetta Topping 
Olives, pack of 20 Japanese coasters inspired by Sharaku, Foglie Di Carciofo Artichoke Leaf Pasta, Italian-decorated olive 
oil bottle, Pesto alla Genovese Basil Pesto, Dark Chocolate Mexicano Oaxacan Sampler of Stone Ground Chocolate, 
Guylian Artisanal Belgian Chocolates, Oreos drenched in Belgian Chocolate, 

B54 Iron 3 wine bottle holder - Wrought iron three wine bottle holder, Concha y Toro Gran Reserva 2010 Merlot, vintage 1960's 
British Butler tea towel, opener, pasta

B55 Nevaeh Salon certificate - Nevaeh Aveda Concept Salon gift certificate  for a complimentary haircut with Aimee up to 
$40.00, Expires March 30, 2017

B56 Bill Davis Roofing Certificate - Certificate good for up to $1000 worth of roofing service from Bill Davis Roofing

B57 Pie Five pizza gift cards - 5 free pizza pie gift cards from Pie Five Pizza Company which has the fastest cooking pizzas!

B58 Santa's Reindeer pillow - Santa's Reindeer pillow by Mary Lake Thompson

B59 Lighted Wreath - 24” Multicolor Lighted Artificial Wreath

B60 Metal Doll Bed - 16 1/2” Black metal doll bed, mattress, and linens suitable for Barbie dolls, Disney Animators' dolls, baby 
dolls, and more

B61 Daylily Gift Certificate - Mo-Kan Daylily Society $25 gift certificate good for 5 bare root Daylily Double Fans cultivar at the 
2017 Daylily Plant Sale

B62 Here Comes Santa Claus Wreath - 28” green wreath hand-decorated with santa collectibles, bells, and a wooden Ho, Ho, 
Ho sign

B63 Chico's gift card - Chico's gift card

B64 Christmas with Ella - Christmas classics CD by Ella Fitzgerald and a Hallmark Keepsake Ornament that plays Ella 
Fitzgerald singing The Christmas Song.

B65 Poinsettia plant - One poinsettia plant from Suburban Lawn and Garden

B66 Decanter and six wine goblets – Shannon Crystal Designs of Ireland decanter, stopper, and six wine goblets

B67 Delicious in Any Language - Sartirano Cantine E Vigneti Monforte D Alba Delicius White Wine, two white napkins, metal 
wine holder

B68 Natalie's Lucky Charm girl doll - Natalia's Lucky Charm handmade girl doll beautifully made of 100% cotton and 
nonallergenic polyester fiberfill, made and donated by Natalia Harris



B69 Price Chopper gift card - Price Chopper $25 gift card donated by Cosentino's Price Chopper in Ranchmart at 3700 West 
95th Street, Leawood, KS 66206, Cosentino's is a local family-owned business who have built relationships – one customer 
at a time.

B70 Crimson Crocheted Throw Blanket - Crimson heart pattern hand-crocheted throw blanket or baby blanket by local artist 
Carolyn Shephardson

B71 Sterling Silver Flower Diamonique Necklace - Sterling Silver 18” necklace with Diamonique stones in a flower pattern

B73 Honora Pearls and leather necklace - Honora Pearls necklace of sterling silver and braided leather

B74 Sterling Silver necklace with Honora Pearls - Sterling Silver necklace spaced with Honora Pearls

B75 Jewelry created by Designs by Dave - Jewelry created by Designs by Dave

C1 Thomas Kinkade book - The Artist in Nature, Thomas Kinkade and the Plein Air Tradition book

C2 Gardening Books - Time Life The Big Book of Garden Design, Better Homes and Gardens Complete Guide to Gardening, 
The Well-Tended Perennial Garden books

C3 The Ninth Beethoven and the World in 1824 book - The Ninth Beethoven and the World in 1824 book by Harvey Sachs

C4 The Great Composers book - The Great Composers, The Lives and Music of 50 Great Classical Composers book

C5 Three Fiction Novels - Three Fiction Novels: The Shack by Wm Paul Young, The Bridge by Evan S. Connell, The Kitchen 
Boy by Robert Alexander

C6 Stories of Survival - Island of Hope, Island of Tears by  Brownstone, Franck & Brownstone, Founding Mothers by Cokie 
Roberts, The Northern Wind by Therese Park, The True Story of Hansel and Gretel by Louise Murphy

C7 Memoirs - Things I've Been Silent About by Azar Nafisi, Her Mother's Daughter by Linda Carroll, The Liar's Club by Mary 
Karr, and Running with Scissors by Augusten Burroughs

C8 Tales As Old As Time - Milkweed by Mary Gardner, Creek Mary's Blood by Dee Brown, Ragtime by E. L. Doctorow, Little 
Altars Everywhere by Rebecca Wells, War and Remembrance Volumes I and II

C9 Orchestral Music of Brahms LPs - Philharmonic-Symphony Orchestra of New York playing Orchestral Music of Brahms on 
four LPs

C10 Offenbach La Vie Parisienne LPs - Offenbach La Vie Parisienne on 2 LPs

C11 Bach Organ Favorites LPs - Bach Organ Favorites, E. Power Biggs, Recorded on the Flentrop Organ at Harvard University 
three LP set

C12 The Smithsonian Collection of J S Bach LPs - The Smithsonian Collection of music of Johann Sebastion Bach on 9 LPs

C13 Time-Life The Baroque Era LPs - Time-Life The Story of Great Music: The Baroque Era LPs

C14 Time-Life Prelude to Modern Music LPs - Time-Life The Story of Great Music: Prelude to Modern Music LPs

C15 Time-Life Age of Revolution LPs - Time-Life The Story of Great Music: Age of Revolution LPs

C16 Time-Life The Opulent Era LPs - Time-Life The Story of Great Music: The Opulent Era LPs

C17 Time-Life The Romantic Era LPs - Time-Life The Story of Great Music: The Romantic Era LPs

C18 Paul Robeson LPs: Scandalize My Name - The Classics Record Library Paul Robeson Scandalize My Name three LP set

Thank you for supporting KCCO!
www.kccivic.org


